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      Municipality of Clarington 

 

SUMMARY OF BID RESULTS 
 

Tender CL2011-34, Grass Cutting & Trimming 
 

BIDDER Section 1 
Courtice/Darlington 

Section 3 
Newcastle/Clarke

B&D Tractor Services 
Bowmanville, ON 

$74,478.07 No Bid 

Town & Country Lawn Maintenance 
Bailieboro, ON  

$76,702.21 $44,513.23 

B.J. Flint and Sons 
Bowmanville, ON 

$83,076.67 $50,713.95 

GWS Landscaping  
Bowmanville, ON 

$86,922.62 $42,449.76 

Tom’s Landscaping Maintenance & Design 
Courtice, ON  

$99,605.68 $66,130.15 

Regional Property Services 
Whitby, ON  

$140,348.04 No Bid 

Algonquin Property Services 
Ajax, ON  

$159,303.78 $94,581.23 

The Grounds Guys  
Oshawa, ON                           

$180,826.10 No Bid 

Clintar Landscape Management / Fore North Inc. 
Whitby, ON 

$426,924.85 $248,615.03 

The Grounds Guys  
Cobourg, ON  

No Bid Bid Withdrawn 

 
 


